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of their core businesses when it comes to issues, such as drug

t, it demon-

approach can benefit shareholder returns over

the long term by improving margins and valuation multiples. The idea

of a company's total societal impact (TSI), as the study describes it, and

consideration of atl stakeholders are areas many of the world's largest

institutional investors are increasingly looking to measure and monitor.

As the third-largest investment manager in the world, we have been

managing ESG strategies for more than 30 years.l Yet as the authors of
this study suggest, we are at the dawn of profound new developments

when it comes to thinking about ESG and impact investing. Investors

have come a long way from the negative screening that characterized

the early forms of what was initially called socially responsible investing

(SRI). We have progressed toward positive, thematic ESG tilts such as

State Street's gender diversity and carbon-neutral indexes and are now

focusing on fully integrating ESG issues into our investment risk frame-

works and those of our client institutions. That process has relied heavi-

ly on the insights and data provided by studies like this one. Efforts to

quantify the financial implications of ESG factors help investment man-

agers incorporate them into investment models, both as signals for iden-

tifying outperformance potential and as red flags for potential risks.

Still, we all have much more work to do, as the report indicates. A
growing number of institutions around the world want to broaden
their long-term investment objectives beyond traditional financial
metrics to include the economic, environmental, and societal impact
of their investment programs. This presents critical challenges for in-

vestment managers to come up with new kinds of performance score-

cards that include atfiibutes such as the carbon profile of an invest-

ment portfolio or scores related to workforce quality and supply chain

sustainability. As the authors point out, many companies are able to
measure the outcomes directly associated with their core businesses

but have difficulty sizing their ultimate societal impact.

One of the most important preconditions for advancing to this new

stage is access to high-quality and consistent data to assess these new

factors when we are analyzing companies. As BCG notes, the ability to

FORE,WORD

THr Bosror,r CoNSULTi NG CaouP la

ing the financial materiality of these attributes. But it also breaks new

ground in trying to help companies capture the broader societal impact



measure the impact of environmental issues such as water resource
management or carbon intensity is more advanced than the means of
quantifying the influence of more intangible issues such as purpose-
driven work cultures or community impact.

Fortunately, many organizations are working to address this data chal-
lenge. For example, with its recommended disclosure standards, the
Financial Stability Board's Taskforce on Climate-Related Financial
Disclosures (TCFD) has provided a foundation for improving our abili
ty to assess and price appropriately climate-related risks and opportu-
nities. Investment managers like us are also encouraging companies
to provide more robust and consistent reporting of environmental, so-
cial, and governance issues. As one of the largest ETF and index man-
agers in the world, we have made sustainability issues around ESG a
central focus of our active stewardship practice. Because we are
near-permanent capital (if a company is included in an index, we
must own it on behalf of our clients), we have, by definition, a long-
term perspective on how ESG issues can impact a company's ability
to deliver attractive returns. For that reason, we have called upon
companies to analyze and report in detail how sustainability issues
might impact their long-term strategy and capital allocation decisions.

The BCG study rightly distinguishes the effects across sectors. The oil
and gas industry as the authors note, will obviously have different op-
portunities and challenges than biopharmaceuticals, technology,
banking, or consumer packaged goods. We believe more industry-
specific and regional-specific research is still needed.

As the report suggests, institutional investors, both asset owners and
asset managers, have a crucial role to play in helping to advance this
next frontier in impact investing. Global institutional assets under
management represent trillions of capital firepower to put behind in-
creasing industry knowledge and understanding.

Undeniably, there is a growing appreciation that companies need to
consider the interests of a broader group ofstakeholders beyond
shareholders alone, including society as a whole. This, we believe, is
the future. Integrating these issues into corporate strategy can funda-
mentally change the way businesses think about what makes them
successful. As this research vividly demonstrates, successfully manag-
ing total societal impact can measurably improve total shareholder re-
turns by motivating employees, buitding loyalty and trust with cus-
tomers, and strengthening relationships with policymakers.

-Ronald 
P. O'Hanley,

Presidmt and CEO, State Street Global Aduisors

NoTE
1. All rankings according to State Sheet Global Advisors, December 31,2016. Data
updated annually.
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